
Ash's Cabin
by Jen Wang
YGN Wang
Ash seeks an escape from the
miserable feeling of alienation that
haunts their daily life in modern
society but discovers making the
wilds their home isn't easy. Ash
wonders if they can really be happy
surviving alone.

Lunar New Year Love
Story
by Gene Luen Yang
YGN Yang
Valentina believes her love life is
cursed, until the Lunar New Year
introduces her to charming lion
dancer boys and a chance at
breaking the curse.

The Girl Who Sang
by Estelle Nadel
YGN Biography Nadel
When the Nazis invade her small
Polish town, Enia Feld is separated
from her family, forced into hiding,
and survives at the mercy of her
neighbors in this graphic memoir.

Indiginerds
by Alina Pete
YGN Biography Indiginerds
An exhilarating celebration
collecting 11 stories about
Indigenous people balancing
traditional ways of knowing with
modern pop culture, featuring an
all-Indigenous creative team.
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The Summer Hikaru Died
by Mokumokuren
YGN Summer Hikaru
It has Hikaru's face. It has Hikaru's
voice. It has Hikaru's memories. But
whatever came down from the
mountains six months ago isn't
Yoshiki's best friend. It's dangerous.

Brownstone
by Samuel Teer
YGN Teer
Left with her Guatemalan father for
the summer Almudena gets to know
the residents of her Latin American
neighborhood while helping her dad
fix a broken-down brownstone and
their strained relationship.

Northranger
by Rey Terciero
YGN Terciero
Swoony and spooky teen summer
romance set on a Texas ranch. Cade
Munoz finds himself falling for the
ranch owner's mysterious,
handsome son, who may be
harboring a dangerous secret.

Bunt!
by Ngozi Ukazu
YGN Ukazu
On day one at college, Molly
discovers her full-ride scholarship
has vanished! But PICA's dusty
financial aid documents reveal a
loophole. If Molly and 9 other art
students win a single game of
softball, they'll receive a massive
athletic scholarship.

Teen

Graphic
Novel

Full-length stories told through
visual art
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Young Adult Teen Graphic
Novels

The Pale Queen
by Ethan M. Aldridge
YGN Aldridge
Agatha catches the attention of the
mysterious Lady of the Hills, who
reveals a hidden magical world in
the misty land next to her village.
Agatha falls under her spell until she
learns the Lady's sinister agenda.

Cat on the Hero's Lap
by Kousuke Iijima
YGN Cat On
Red embarked on a journey to
defeat the great demon king, but
then a cat sat on Red's lap and fell
asleep. There's no way he can fight
monsters like this! Is Red's greatest
enemy right on top of him?

Your Letter
by Hyeon A. Cho
YGN Cho
Hoping for a fresh start at her new
school, Sori is about to embark on
the scavenger hunt of a lifetime!
What starts off as simple curiosity
becomes a healing journey through
one small act of kindness.

Ghost Roast
by Shawnelle Gibbs
YGN Gibbs
When a night out with the popular
crowd ends in disaster, high school
student Chelsea Grant is forced to
work for her dad at Paranormal
Removal Services where she
discovers she can actually see
ghosts and tries to keep it a secret.

Hellaween
by Moss Lawton
YGN Hellaween
When her quest leads to a string of
unintended consequences, aspiring
witch Gwen must team up with a
pair of neighborhood do-gooders to
take on something even scarier than
being a teen.

I'm Kinda Chubby and I'm
Your Hero
by Nore
YGN I'm Kinda
Honjirou is an actor trying to land a
breakout role. He fears his weight
stands in the way of his dreams, but
someone supporting his work gives
him a new confidence on the stage.

A Kingdom of Quartz
by Bomhat
YGN Kingdom
Where fledgling angel wings are
downy white, Blue's are pitch black.
Is she cursed? When her orphanage
comes under attack by a host of
demons, Blue feels a dark power
welling up inside of her.

Nothing Special
by Katie Cook
YGN Nothing
Callie thinks she's nothing special.
But on her birthday, signs of a
struggle point to the portal to the
magical realm; and when there are
signs, you follow them. Now it's up
to Callie, Declan, and Radish to bring
Callie's dad home.

Obey Me!
by Subaru Nitou
YGN Obey
A human exchange student wakes
up as a little wooly sheep at the
Royal Academy of Devildom, where
seven demon brothers await. But
how did this human end up
a sheep?

Malcolm Kid and the
Perfect Song
by Austin Paramore
YGN Paramore
Malcolm's keyboard is cursed with
the soul of an old jazz musician, and
the only way to free the soul is by
performing the perfect song.

Royal Tailor Clothier to
the Crown
by Nakasane Nowaki
YGN Royal Tailor
In a fantasy world where humans are
discriminated against, getting work
as a seamstress is a struggle. Then a
handsome and mysterious prince
offers Hana a job.

Just Another Story
by Ernesto Saade
YGN Saade
When Carlos was 19-years-old, his
mother decided to leave her life in El
Salvador. Refusing to let her go
without him, Carlos joined the
journey north. Together they
experience the risks countless
people faces as they migrate.
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